THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009 -

CONTRACT #09-2
SCHOOL BUS TRANSPORTATION FOR SUMMER RECREATION PROGRAMS

11:00 AM

VENDOR

BID
BOND

IAFFIRMATIVE ACTION FORM

MANDATORY LANGUAGE

NON-COLLUSION
AFFIDAVIT
STOCKHOLDER

DISCLOSURE

BUSINESS REGISTRATION

CERTIFICATE

SIGNED
PROPOSAL

TOTAL OPTION A
(with Item A)

TOTAL OPTION B

TOTAL OPTION C

#1 TOTAL BID

TOTAL OPTION A
(with Item B)

TOTAL OPTION B

TOTAL OPTION C

#2 TOTAL BID

EXCEPTIONS

J & M Keelan
142 Belmont Avenue
Long Branch, NJ 07740

NO BID

Jay's Bus Service
180 Park Avenue
Lakewood, NJ 08701

NO BID

Keyport Autobody Shop, Inc. t/a
Shamrock Stage Coach

347 Main Street
Keansburg, NJ 07734

NO BID

Durham School Services
49 Kanes Lane
Middletown, NJ 07748

$9,850.00

$12,505.00

$305.00

$22,660.00

$7,700.00

$12,505.00

$305.00

$20,510.00

None

STA
501 Prospect Street
Lakewood, NJ 08701

$8,750.00

$13,475.00

$220.00

$22,445.00

$8,750.00

$13,475.00

$220.00

$22,445.00

None

Star Shuttle
136 Freeway Drive
East Orange, NJ 07019

NO BID




