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TOTAL OPTION A      
#1 & 2 Routes      TOTAL OPTION B TOTAL BID                   TOTAL OPTION A      

#3 Route              TOTAL OPTION B        TOTAL BID                     EXCEPTIONS

Ride Station
1399 Lower Ferry Road No Bid
Ewing, NJ 08618

Phoenix Transporation, LLC

27 fox Run No Bid
Monore Township, NJ 08831

Klarr Transport Srvc. Inc. $8,740.00 50 Passenger $11,835.00 $20, 575.00 $5,070.00 50 Passenger $11,835.00 $16,905.00 None

999 Airport Road, Suite 3a x x x
x x x

Lakewood, NJ 08701 $8,720.00 20 Passenger 11,835.00 $20,555.00 $4,992.00 20 Passenger $11,835.00 $16,827.00 None

Irvin Raphaal, Inc. $10,868.00 50 Passenger $6,709.50 17,577.50 $5,434.00 50 Passenger $6,709.50 $12,143.50 None

55 Old Stage Road x x x
x x x

East Brunswick, NJ 08816 Same 20 Passenger $6,709.50 $17,577.50 Same 20 Passenger $6,709.50 $12,143.50 None

Jay's Bus Service
180 Park Avenue No Bid
Lakewood, NJ  08701

Keyport Autobody Shop, Inc. t/a 
Shamrock Stage Coach

347 Main Street No Bid
Keansburg, NJ 07734

Durham School Services
$9,850.00 50 Passenger $10,986.00 $20,836.00 $5,122.00 50 Passenger $10,986.00 $16,108.00 None

49 Kanes Lane

Middletown, NJ 07748 $7,392.00 20 Passenger $10,986.00 $18,378.00 $4,435.00 20 Passenger $10,986.00 $15,421.00 None

S T A 
$8,840.00 50 Passenger $9,026.00 $17,866.00 $4,420.00 50 Passenger $9,026.00 $13,446.00 None

501 Prospect Street

Lakewood, NJ  08701 Same 20 Passenger $9,026.00 $17.866.00 Same 20 Passenger $9,026.00 $13,446.00 None

Star Shuttle

136 Freeway Drive No Bid
East Orange, NJ 07019

x

CONTRACT #10-3
SCHOOL BUS TRANSPORTATION FOR SUMMER RECREATION PROGRAMS

THURSDAY, JUNE 3, 2010   -   11:00 AM
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